MOSELEYARCHITECTS

TABULATION OF BIDS

Project: Cleveland County 911 Center & EOC

Architect’s Commission No.:

613024

Bids Receipt Time: 2:00 PM on February 29, 2024
Bids Opening Time: 2:00 PM on February 29, 2024

General Contractors

G.W. Liles Construction

Greene Building

Hamlett Associates

Harper General Contractors

JM Cope Construction

Metcon Construction

Neill Construction

Corporation Company
Base Bid Price: $5,300,310.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5,177,827.00 No Bid $6,214,095.00
Total Base Bid Price (including allowances) $5,355,206.00 $5,227,139.70 $6,260,000.00
Alternate No. 1 - Emergency Operations Center Building: $1,872,321.00 $2,396,254.35 $2,541,000.00
Total Base Bid + Alternate 1 $7,227,527.00 $7,623,394.05 $8,801,000.00
Alternate No. 2 - Paving of Gravel Parking and Drives: $42,350.00 $17,000.00 $31,500.00
Total Base Bid + Alternates 1 and 2 $7,269,877.00 $7,640,394.05 $8,832,500.00
Alternate No. 3 - Owner-Preferred Alternate - Honeywell Controls: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total Base Bid + Alternate 1, 2 and 3 $7,269,877.00 $7,640,394.05 $8,832,500.00
Receipt of Addenda 1-2 acknowledged Y Y Y
Unit Prices acl ledged and leted Y Y Y
North Carolina General Contractor License Number 26158 71908 7539
MWBE forms included Y Y Y
Bid Form signed and sealed Y Y Y
Bid Security (5%) attached Y Y Y

Notes:

1. GW Liles Construction provided with their bid all the proper MWBE forms, however the space provided on the bid form was not properly marked to reflect the attached forms.




